
Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

19-0023 Highway Emergency Lane Patrol (H.E.L.P.) Program Sponsorship 

December 2, 2019: Time:10:30 AM 

Vendor Name: Total Sponsorship Fee 

Travelers Marketing LLC $1,803,000.00 
 



Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

18-0145 Navistar Truck Repair Services 
Bid Solicitation 20-557THA-PROCU-B-11105 

Wednesday, December 04, 2019 Time: 10:30 a.m. Room: 850 

Vendor Name: Lakeside International LLC 

 Paper Bid &  Electronic Bid 

Total Bid Table 1 – Labor Rate per Hour / Line 1 $149,850.00 

Total Bid Table 2 – OEM Parts and Third-Party Repairs / Lines 2 and 3 $110,000.00 

Total Bid Table 3 – Non-OEM Parts / Line 4 $9,950.00 

Total Bid (Tables 1 through 3) $269,800.00 
 
 
 

http://www.illinoistollway.com/


Bid results are read as submitted at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and review of mathematical calculations. 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

18-0119 Replacement Doors and Hardware 
BidBuy Bid Reference #19-557THA-OPERA-B-11373, Thursday, December 5, 2019 

 

Vendor Name: 

NO BIDS 
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BID OPENING RESULTS 

IFB 
18-0123 CRACK SEALANT 

BID SOLICITATION 19-557THA-PROCU-B-11732 
THURSDAY, DECEMBER 19, 2019 ROOM: 225 TIME: 10:30 A.M. 

 

Vendor Name: Total Bid 

1. Right/Pointe, LLC $434,791.50 

2. Tiles In Style $585,900.00 
 
 



BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

18-0111R-SAND STONE AND GRAVEL 
BID SOLICITATION 20-557THA-PROCU-B-11347 

THURSDAY, DECEMBER 19, 2019 ROOM: 225 TIME: 10:30 A.M. 

4 VENDOR NAME: COOTS MATERIALS CO. 

 PAPER BID &  ELECTRONIC BID 

LINE # DESCRIPTION 
EXTENSION  

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES X 
UNIT PRICE) 

1 SAND, NATURAL 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $0.00 

2 ROAD GRAVEL, #9 (CA 10) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $34,200.00 

3 GRAVEL, 3/8” (CA 16) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP:  $0.00 

4 STONE, ¾” (CA 7) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $32,400.00 

5 STONE, CRUSHED (CA 5) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $4,500.00 

6 STONE, 2” (CA 3) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $65,100.00 



BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

18-0111R-SAND STONE AND GRAVEL 
BID SOLICITATION 20-557THA-PROCU-B-11347 

THURSDAY, DECEMBER 19, 2019 ROOM: 225 TIME: 10:30 A.M. 

1 VENDOR NAME: COOTS MATERIALS CO. 

 PAPER BID &  ELECTRONIC BID 

LINE # DESCRIPTION 
EXTENSION  

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES X 
UNIT PRICE) 

1 SAND, NATURAL 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $0.00 

2 ROAD GRAVEL, #9 (CA 10) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $34,200.00 

3 GRAVEL, 3/8” (CA 16) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP:  $0.00 

4 STONE, ¾” (CA 7) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $32,400.00 

5 STONE, CRUSHED (CA 5) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $4,500.00 

6 STONE, 2” (CA 3) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $65,100.00 



7 STONE, 3” (CA 1) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $60,900.00 

8 STONE, 5” 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $50,625.00 

9 STONE, 10” 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP $94,500.00 

10 
RENEWAL OPTION EXERCISED FOR THE PERIOD OF 
THREE (3) YEARS 11/2022 THROUGH 11/2025 $342,255.00 

 



BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

18-0111R-SAND STONE AND GRAVEL 
BID SOLICITATION 20-557THA-PROCU-B-11347 

THURSDAY, DECEMBER 19, 2019 ROOM: 225 TIME: 10:30 A.M. 

2 VENDOR NAME: TILES IN STYLE 

 PAPER BID &  ELECTRONIC BID 

LINE # DESCRIPTION 
EXTENSION  

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES X 
UNIT PRICE) 

1 SAND, NATURAL 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: 
EAST DUNDEE R.72 WEST OF BEVERLY RD $23,109.38 

2 
ROAD GRAVEL, #9 (CA 10) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: 
MCCOOK STONE PLANT VULCAN $47,241.00 

3 GRAVEL, 3/8” (CA 16) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: 
 BARBERS CORNERS STONE VULCAN $17,400.00 

4 
STONE, ¾” (CA 7) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: 
LEMONT STONE, MCCOOK STONE, SYCAMORE 
STONE, VULCAN $57,746.25 

5 
STONE, CRUSHED (CA 5) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: 
MCCOOK STONE, SYCAMORE STONE, VULCAN $8,835.94 



6 
STONE, 2” (CA 3) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: 
BARTLETT STONE VULCAN $109,565.63 

7 

STONE, 3” (CA 1) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: 
BARBERS CORNERS STONE, LEMONT STONE, 
MCCOOK STONE $99,343.13 

8 
STONE, 5” 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: 
LEMONT STONE, SYCAMORE STONE, VULCAN $168,562.50 

9 

STONE, 10” 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP 
LEMONT STONE, MCCOOK STONE, SYCAMORE 
STONE VULCAN $221,850.00 

 
 



BID OPENING RESULTS 
IFB  

18-0111R-SAND STONE AND GRAVEL 
BID SOLICITATION 20-557THA-PROCU-B-11347 

THURSDAY, DECEMBER 19, 2019 ROOM: 225 TIME: 10:30 A.M. 

3 VENDOR NAME: WILLIAM CHARLES CONSTRUCTION COMPANY LLC 

 PAPER BID &  ELECTRONIC BID 

LINE # DESCRIPTION 
EXTENSION  

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES X 
UNIT PRICE) 

1 

SAND, NATURAL 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: 
AIRPORT PIT - 6230 BELTLINE RD. 
ROCKFORD, IL 61109 $8,287.50 

2 ROAD GRAVEL, #9 (CA 10) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $NO BID 

3 

GRAVEL, 3/8” (CA 16) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP:  
AIRPORT PIT – 6230 BELTLINE RD. 
ROCKFORD, IL 61109 $11,250.00 

4 STONE, ¾” (CA 7) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $NO BID 

5 STONE, CRUSHED (CA 5) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $NO BID 

6 STONE, 2” (CA 3) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $NO BID 



7 STONE, 3” (CA 1) 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $NO BID 

8 STONE, 5” 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP: $NO BID 

9 STONE, 10” 
LOCATION(S) OF PIT(S) OR QUARRY(IES) WHERE 
MATERIAL MAY BE PICKED-UP $NO BID 

 




