
BID RESULTS 
IFB 

08-0055R Safe Repair 
Tuesday, September 2, 2008  

Vendor Name 

M. Lange,  Inc. 

Regular Hourly Rate $ 75.00/hour 

Overtime Hourly Rate $ 112.50/hour 

Sundays and Holidays Rate  $ 150.00/hour 

Total $75.00/hour 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com

 
 

These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

http://www.illinoistollway.com/


These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors.      

BID RESULTS 
IFB 

 
08-0080 Pick-up Disposal of Scrap Rubber Tire Pieces 

Wednesday, September 3, 2008  

 

Vendor Name Unit Price Per TON 

Disposal Waste Services, LLC $125.00 
 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com 



These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

BID RESULTS 
IFB 

 
08-0089 Towing Services 

Wednesday September 03, 2008 

 

Vendor Name  

Redmons Village Towing Inc. 

LOCATION/Bid Area 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “A” 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “B” 

M-1 Alsip No Bid No Bid 

M-2 Hillside No Bid No Bid 

M-3 Park Ridge No Bid No Bid 

M-4 Gurnee No Bid No Bid 

M-5 Schaumburg $3,825.00 $5,250.00 

M-6 Marengo No Bid No Bid 

M-7 Rockford No Bid No Bid 

M-8 Naperville No Bid No Bid 

M-11 DeKalb No Bid No Bid 

M-12 Dixon No Bid No Bid 

M-14/CAP Downers Grove $7,425.00 $8,480.00 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com 



These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

BID RESULTS 
IFB 

 
08-0089 Towing Services 

Wednesday September 03, 2008 

 

Vendor Name  

Lovett’s Rite Way Rebuilders, Inc. 

LOCATION/Bid Area 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “A” 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “B” 

M-1 Alsip No Bid No Bid 

M-2 Hillside No Bid No Bid 

M-3 Park Ridge No Bid No Bid 

M-4 Gurnee No Bid No Bid 

M-5 Schaumburg No Bid No Bid 

M-6 Marengo No Bid No Bid 

M-7 Rockford No Bid No Bid 

M-8 Naperville No Bid No Bid 

M-11 DeKalb $4,950.00 $4,825.00 

M-12 Dixon $5,150.00 $4,925.00 

M-14/CAP Downers Grove No Bid No Bid 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com 



These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

BID RESULTS 
IFB 

 
08-0089 Towing Services 

Wednesday September 03, 2008 

 

Vendor Name  

E&R Towing and Garage, Inc. 

LOCATION/Bid Area 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “A” 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “B” 

M-1 Alsip $2,775.00 $4,425.00 

M-2 Hillside No Bid No Bid 

M-3 Park Ridge No Bid No Bid 

M-4 Gurnee No Bid No Bid 

M-5 Schaumburg No Bid No Bid 

M-6 Marengo No Bid No Bid 

M-7 Rockford No Bid No Bid 

M-8 Naperville $2,775.00 No Bid 

M-11 DeKalb No Bid No Bid 

M-12 Dixon No Bid No Bid 

M-14/CAP Downers Grove No Bid No Bid 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com 



These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

BID RESULTS 
IFB 

 
08-0089 Towing Services 

Wednesday September 03, 2008 

 

Vendor Name  

Pete’s “A” Towing, Inc. 

LOCATION/Bid Area 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “A” 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “B” 

M-1 Alsip No Bid No Bid 

M-2 Hillside No Bid No Bid 

M-3 Park Ridge No Bid No Bid 

M-4 Gurnee No Bid No Bid 

M-5 Schaumburg $2,725..00 $1,375.00 

M-6 Marengo $2,725.00 $1,3.75.00 

M-7 Rockford No Bid No Bid 

M-8 Naperville No Bid No Bid 

M-11 DeKalb No Bid No Bid 

M-12 Dixon No Bid No Bid 

M-14/CAP Downers Grove No Bid No Bid 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com 



These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

BID RESULTS 
IFB 

 
08-0089 Towing Services 

Wednesday September 03, 2008 

 

Vendor Name  

R.B.S. Enterprise, LTD. d/b/a RB’s Automotive & Towing 

LOCATION/Bid Area 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “A” 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “B” 

M-1 Alsip $3,300.00 $0.00 

M-2 Hillside No Bid No Bid 

M-3 Park Ridge No Bid No Bid 

M-4 Gurnee No Bid No Bid 

M-5 Schaumburg No Bid No Bid 

M-6 Marengo No Bid No Bid 

M-7 Rockford No Bid No Bid 

M-8 Naperville No Bid No Bid 

M-11 DeKalb No Bid No Bid 

M-12 Dixon No Bid No Bid 

M-14/CAP Downers Grove No Bid No Bid 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com 



These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

BID RESULTS 
IFB 

 
08-0089 Towing Services 

Wednesday September 03, 2008 

 

Vendor Name  

Lin-Mar Motors, Inc. 

LOCATION/Bid Area 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “A” 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “B” 

M-1 Alsip No Bid No Bid 

M-2 Hillside $3,750.00 $4,400.00 

M-3 Park Ridge $3,750.00 $4,400.00 

M-4 Gurnee No Bid No Bid 

M-5 Schaumburg $3,750.00 $4,400.00 

M-6 Marengo No Bid No Bid 

M-7 Rockford No Bid No Bid 

M-8 Naperville No Bid No Bid 

M-11 DeKalb No Bid No Bid 

M-12 Dixon No Bid No Bid 

M-14/CAP Downers Grove No Bid No Bid 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com 



These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

BID RESULTS 
IFB 

 
08-0089 Towing Services 

Wednesday September 03, 2008 

 

Vendor Name  

XL Towing & Storage, Inc. 

LOCATION/Bid Area 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “A” 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “B” 

M-1 Alsip $5,125.00 $2,020.00 

M-2 Hillside No Bid No Bid 

M-3 Park Ridge No Bid No Bid 

M-4 Gurnee No Bid No Bid 

M-5 Schaumburg No Bid No Bid 

M-6 Marengo No Bid No Bid 

M-7 Rockford No Bid No Bid 

M-8 Naperville No Bid No Bid 

M-11 DeKalb No Bid No Bid 

M-12 Dixon No Bid No Bid 

M-14/CAP Downers Grove No Bid No Bid 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com 



These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

BID RESULTS 
IFB 

 
08-0089 Towing Services 

Wednesday September 03, 2008 

 

Vendor Name  

Walsh’s Service Station, Inc. 

LOCATION/Bid Area 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “A” 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “B” 

M-1 Alsip $4,625.00 $2,800.00 

M-2 Hillside No Bid No Bid 

M-3 Park Ridge No Bid No Bid 

M-4 Gurnee No Bid No Bid 

M-5 Schaumburg No Bid No Bid 

M-6 Marengo No Bid No Bid 

M-7 Rockford No Bid No Bid 

M-8 Naperville No Bid No Bid 

M-11 DeKalb No Bid No Bid 

M-12 Dixon No Bid No Bid 

M-14/CAP Downers Grove No Bid No Bid 



These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

BID RESULTS 
IFB 

 
08-0089 Towing Services 

Wednesday September 03, 2008 

 

Vendor Name  

West & Sons Towing, Inc. 

LOCATION/Bid Area 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “A” 
Total Bid  

Rate Schedule “B” 

M-1 Alsip No Bid No Bid 

M-2 Hillside $2,950.00 $4,525.00 

M-3 Park Ridge No Bid No Bid 

M-4 Gurnee No Bid No Bid 

M-5 Schaumburg $3,950.00 $4,525.00 

M-6 Marengo No Bid No Bid 

M-7 Rockford No Bid No Bid 

M-8 Naperville No Bid No Bid 

M-11 DeKalb No Bid No Bid 

M-12 Dixon No Bid No Bid 

M-14/CAP Downers Grove $8,150.00 $7,160.00 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com 



These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors.     Page 2 

BID RESULTS 
IFB 

 
08-0025 Door Replacement at Central Administration 

Wednesday September 10, 2008 

 

Vendor Name Total Bid 

Semford Management & Construction Inc. $ 79,952.00 

American Building Services, LLC $109,713.00 

R. Rudnick & Co. d/b/a  R. Rudnick & Co. $102,269.00 

 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com 



BID RESULTS 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com

IFB 
08-0157 

 Refurbishing Services for Extrusions and Aluminum Sign Blanks 
Wednesday, September 24, 2008 

 

Vendor Name 

Advanced Water Jet Technologies LLC 

Per Square Foot Per Linear Foot 

$1.13 $2.45 

 

These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

http://www.illinoistollway.com/


BID RESULTS 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com

IFB 
 

08-0159 
Flatbed Plotter Cutter 

 

Vendor Name Total Bid 

Western Remac Inc. $79,987.00 

Tapco $98,000.00 

 

These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

http://www.illinoistollway.com/


BID RESULTS 

The Illinois State Toll Highway Authority 
2700 Ogden Avenue 
Downers Grove, Illinois 60515-1703 
630/241-6800 
630/241-6100 Fax 
630/241-6898 TTY 
1-800-TOLL-FYI Road Conditions 
www.illinoistollway.com

IFB 
 

08-0166 
 Semi Automatic Circular Miter Saw 

Wednesday, September 24, 2008 
 

Vendor Name Total Bid 

QC Enterprises, Inc $40,588.24 

Gladwin Machinery & Supply of Illinois Inc. $33,535.00 

 

These bid results are as read at the bid opening.   
Results are subject to review for compliance to specifications and correction of mathematical 
errors. 

http://www.illinoistollway.com/
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